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Dear colleagues,

Looking back to our four year period we see IFP with
some noticeable changes. The most important one is
probably the collaboration with a highly renowned
journal, Psychotherapy and Psychosomatics. 

The most visible is our new logo and ifp-homepage
address (www.ifp.name) and the most important
content is the renewal of our mission statement. We
prepared ourselves for a broader public with a new
leaflet and sent out regular information by running
this Newsletter.

We got some new Council-members who endorse
our work and started a new series of seminars
throughout the year. And finally we found a good
collaborating team for the 19th World Congress and
collaborated in many ways to prepare the Congress. 

We do hope to provide with these achievements a
better basis for reaching more member societies – a
challenge we also tried to face but with apparently
less success. 

In this last Newsletter of this election period of our
Board we want to present you a paper of the late
Klaus Grawe. He sent it to us shortly before his death
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which happened in August 2005. Let us take the pub-
lication of this paper (which we had to finalize) as a
sign of respect and gratitude to this innovative
researcher and personality in psychotherapy.



All our members, meaning individual members of
the IFP as well as individual members of associa-
tions who have membership status with the IFP, are
offered the IFP's official journal. "Psychotherapy and

Psychosomatics" at a reduced subscription rate. For
details, please contact S Karger directly at:

S. Karger AG
Journals distribution
PO Box
CH–4009 Basel (Switzerland)
Fax +41 61 306 12 34
E-Mail karger@karger.com

With my presidential term coming to an end in
August 2006, I would once again like to invite every-
body to come forward with nominations for the pres-
idential term 2006-2010. Elections will be held at the
General Assembly which will be scheduled during
the 19th World Congress of Psychotherapy in Kuala
Lumpur.

I do hope to meet you all in Kuala Lumpur
this forthcoming summer!

The 19th World Congress of Psychotherapy is
quickly approaching: as you certainly know by now,
this important conference will be held in the Shangri-
La Hotel in Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia, 22.-26. August
2006. Prof. Thambu Maniam, president of the
Malaysian Psychiatric Association, and myself are
collaborating as co-chairpersons of the organizing
committee, while Prof. Zain Azhar is president of the
scientific program committee. The theme for the
Congress is: „Well-being across cultures: psy-
chotherapy in a biological era“. For more information
such as the scientific program and registration and
accomodation forms, please refer to the announce-
ment in this Newsletter, as well as to the congress
website: http://www.2006wcp-mcpm.com. See also
Prof. Maniam’s and my special welcome later in this
newsletter.

IFP’s most challenging and exciting new project is
the introduction of IFP-sponsored master classes,
seminars and workshops internationally. This way,
we aim at promoting the dissemination of evidence-
based psychotherapeutic approaches. In addition,
IFP-sponsored workshops will provide an opportu-
nity for psychotherapists to become individual mem-
bers of IFP in that participants are offered a substan-
tially reduced registration fee if they are already IFP
members, or choose to apply for IFP membership.
Trainings are conducted by internationally recog-
nized experts. As a start, Prof. Edna B. Foa, Ph.D.,
Philadelphia, USA, gave a four-day training work-
shop on Prolonged Exposure (PE) therapy for chronic
PTSD. The workshop took place on March 15-18,
2006, in Zurich, Switzerland, and I can only say it
was a great success!

The next IFP-sponsored workshop is scheduled to be
held in Venice, Italy, September 22-23, 2006: Prof.
Giovanni Fava, M.D., a member of the IFP Council,
together with Dr. Carlotta Belaise, Dr. Fedra Ottolini,
and Dr. Chiara Ruini will teach Well-Being Therapy
(WBT), a novel psychotherapeutic technique for
enhancing psychological well-being. More informa-
tion regarding this workshop is provided further
down in this IFP News.
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19th World Congress of Psychotherapy, Kuala
Lumpur, Malaysia, 22.-26. August 2006
„Well-being across cultures: Psychotherapy
in a biological era“

„Selamat Datang!“ In the Malaysian National Lanu-
age that means „Welcome“. The Malaysian Psychi-
atric Association MPA and the International Federa-
tion for Psychotherapy IFP warmly welcome you to
the 19th World Congress of Psychotherapy in Kuala
Lumpur. We in Malaysia feel honoured to have been
given the task of organizing this Congress and wel-
come delegates to contributed their expertise, inter-
act with colleagues from other parts of the world
and simply enjoy both the scientific and the social
aspects of the conference.

The world is shrinking. Events and ideas from one
region of the globe that in the past took ages to filter
across to other regiobns are now presented to us at
the touch of a key. The effects of globalization and the
influence of technology have served to reduce the
gaps that existed between peoples. Consequently
there is increasing familiarity with ideas that were
once rejected as foreign. Therapies, Eastern and
Western, have crossed continents. It is in such a cli-
mate that we meet to share, to learn, and to form
bridges.

Nine precongress full day workshops will be held at
the University Putra Kuala Lumpur Clinical campus
which will be accessible by monorail from the hotels
in the KL Golden Triangle near Shangrila where the
Congress proper will be held. Topics are in line with
the main theme of the congress i.e. Well Being
Across Cultures: Psychotherapy in a Biological Era.
Prof. Russell Meares, Australia, will give a keynote
lecture on „Towards a Scientific Basis for Psy-
chotherapy“. Some interesting plenary topics include
working with sex offenders, psychotherapy research,
women’s mental health, psychotherapy and neuro-
physiological perspectives for borderline, psy-
chotherapy in chronic pain, and PTSD. There will also
be topics relating to different cultures by speakers
such as Prof. Bachtiar Lubis from Indonesia, Prof.
Niaz from Pakistan, Prof. Malik Badri from Malaysia,
Dr. Anthony Ang and Douglas Kong from Singapore,
and Prof. Tan Eng Kong from Australia. Other inter-
esting topics include accelerated behaviour cogni-
tive therapy, psychotherapy with the elderly, HIV and

AIDS, eating disorders, challenging the westernized
model of PTSD, cognitive remediation therapy and
not forgetting psychotherapy for children with ADD.
There will also be a topic on false memories.

We hope this congress will be a catalyst in the
process of bridge-building not only cross-culturally
but also within the caring professions of psy-
chotherapy/counselling and psychiatry. Wit advances
in neurobiology, with the ever increasing number of
newer psychopharmacologic agents there is a con-
siderable risk of losing the human being among his
neurotransmitters! We believe the presentations will
help to advance a more holistic and integrated
approach to health and wellbeing.

See you in Kuala Lumpur in August!
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G.A. Fava is Professor of Clinical Psychology at the
University of Bologna and Clinical Professor of Psy-
chiatry at the State University of New York at Buf-
falo. He is the Editor-in-Chief of Psychotherapy and
Psychosomatics. He and his group have performed
groundbreaking research in the prevention of recur-
rent depression and treatment of anxiety disorders.
The seminar provides a unique opportunity to get
acquainted with the innovative psychotherapeutic
techniques of this research group.

Cost: 200 Euro (non International Federation of 
Psychotherapy members)
150 Euro (International Federation of 
Psychotherapy members)

For subscription to the workshop, please apply to
the IFP secretariat at:
secretariat@ifp.name (Cornelia Erpenbeck)

Well-Being Therapy
Prof. G.A. Fava, Dr. Carlotta Belaise, 
Dr. Fedra Ottolini, Dr. Chiara Ruini

Istituto Canossiano, Dorsoduro 1323, 30123 Venezia
September 22-23, 2006

This seminar is the second International Federation
of Psychotherapy sponsored training workshop. It is
an introductory course of well-being therapy, a novel
psychotherapeutic technique for enhancing psycho-
logical well-being developed by Prof. Fava. It pro-
vides information about the background, structure
and applications of this approach which has been
applied to mood and anxiety disorders in controlled
studies. Treatment of individual cases will be
described, with opportunities for discussion and role
playing. The workshop will be in English.

Sep. 22 13.00-15.00 Registration
15.00-19.00 Background, structure, 
applications

Sep. 23 09.00-13.00 Case illustrations
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The second IFP-sponsored psychotherapy
training workshop! New!!

Mission Statement

1. The IFP is a worldwide umbrella organisation for psychotherapy. The Federation is open to profes-
sional societies, institutions and individual members.

2. The IFP aims to promote, endorse and maintain high professional and ethical standards of psy-
chotherapy in practice, research, and training.

3. The IFP fosters a worldwide intercultural, interdisciplinary dialogue and mutual learning among psy-
chotherapists, psychotherapy researchers, psychotherapeutic orientations, traditions, and related
sciences.

4. The IFP provides a platform for the development of theories, methods and treatment approaches,
and promotes the integration of psychotherapeutic thinking in clinical and non-clinical fields. 

The IFP realizes its aims by means of

▪ World congresses (every four years)

▪ Regional congresses

▪ Supporting and co-chairing the organization of scientific congresses of their members and/or
national umbrella organisations (and under certain conditions supporting them also logistically and
financially)

▪ Supporting scientific activities in research, practice, and training, particularly activities of intercul-
tural relevance

▪ Information transfer by constantly updated homepage and newsletters



clearer understanding of the functional relations
within the therapy process to a whole generation of
psychotherapists. The strength of the model is its
clear focus on the therapy process. It conceives of
what is going on between a therapist and patient
and how this is related to so-called input and output
variables. This strength is at the same time a limita-
tion of the model. The model does not include a con-
ception of the intrapersonal processes going on
within the patient leading eventually to the obser-
vable changes in experience and behaviour which
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Agents of Change in the Processes of Psychotherapy

PROF. KLAUS GRAWE, PhD (1943 - 2005) 

The question of how psychotherapy works has ever
been a main focus of psychotherapy research. Liter-
ally thousands of studies have been conducted
investigating the influence of hundreds of variables
on therapeutic outcome. David Orlinsky has tried to
integrate the vast amount of findings on process-
outcome correlations in his Generic Model of Psy-
chotherapy (Orlinsky, Grawe & Parks, 1994). 

Figure 1

This model has been inductively generated on the
basis of a careful analysis of more than two thou-
sand empirical correlations between different
process variables and different aspects of outcome.
Although the model is empirically based it is not just
a summary but an interpretation of the findings gen-
erated so far. It uses constructs (like self relatedness
for example) and assumes functional relations
between process variables which have not or only
very rarely been directly investigated.

The model has been very influential in imparting a
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we call therapeutic outcome. This limits the useful-
ness of the model for therapeutic practice and train-
ing.  Ideally a therapist in his practical work should
not only be guided by a process model but also by a
working model of the patient’s mental functioning
explaining the development and maintenance of his
or her symptoms and problems. This working model
– in the individual case we are speaking of a case
conceptualization – should convey an understand-
ing of what kind of experiences the patient would
have to have during therapy in order to overcome
his problems and feel better.

In the following I’d like to outline a model to you
that aims at connecting a conception of mental func-
tioning including clinically disturbed functioning
with a conception of the determinants of therapeutic
change. The model has been designated „Consis-
tency Theory“ and elaborated in detail in a book pub-
lished in German in 1998. The book is about to
appear in an English translation with the title Psy-
chological Therapy.

After having outlined the model I will report on the
results of two research projects investigating process
variables whose influence on outcome is postulated
by the model.

Of course, my outline of the model itself has to be
very short here. My main focus will be on our empiri-
cal process research guided by the model. I only will
present the most basic constructs and assumptions
of the model and will then derive therapeutic con-
clusions that have been empirically investigated by
us. 

Basic assumptions and constructs of 
consistency theory (Grawe, 1998, 2002)

Underlying all mental processes are neural acti-

vation tendencies (NATs), which are stored in differ-
ent memory systems. The activation tendencies are
organized into cell assemblies (Hebb, 1949), respec-
tively into neural groups (Edelman, 1987). The joining
together of a multitude of specialized neurons into a
neural group is a result of hierarchical organization
(Hubel & Wiesel, 1968) and of synchronous activa-
tion.

It is a fundamental characteristic of mental functio-
ning that numerous processes are ongoing simul-
taneously. The basic principle of psychological func-
tioning is the striving for consistency in the
simultaneously ongoing processes. Simultaneously

actuated neural activation patterns which are fol-
lowed by in increase in consistency are joined
together into a neural group.

Figure 4: 
Synchronous activation and increase in consistency
lead to the formation of a new Neural Group

The formation of new Neural Groups underlies any
change in experience and behaviour. This process is
therefore fundamental both for the understanding
of the development of mental disorders and for the
understanding of therapeutic change. Let’s have a
closer look on this basic learning process.

Synchronously activated

NAPs

followed by an

Increase in consistency

or a

Decrease in inconsistency

are joined together into a

new Neural Group



Figure 6 Striving for satisfaction of basic needs
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Figure 5 (Emergence of New Neural Groups)

If synchronous activation and differential reinforce-

ment through inconsistency reduction co-occur
repeatedly, the new neural activation pattern
becomes more and more engrained. The better the
connections between the elements of a neural group
are established, by frequent synchronous activation
and differential reinforcement, the easier it is to acti-
vate the group as a whole, starting from its parts. 

All our perceptions, our memories, habits, actions,
cognitions, emotions, physiological reactions etc. are
based on neural activation tendencies that have
been acquired by this process of synchronous acti-
vation and differential reinforcement. The better
they‘re engrained, the easier they can be activated
and the more they determine our mental life. This is
also true for the individual components of mental
and psychosomatic disorders. It is also true for the
motivational tendencies an individual develops for
the satisfaction and protection of his or her basic
needs.

HUMAN BEINGS STRIVE FOR THE

SATISAFACTION AND THE PROTECTION

OF THEIR BASIC NEEDS

Influenced by their concrete life

circumstances, people develop approach

goals in the service of need-satisfaction,

avoidance goals in the service of their

protection and means for the attainment

of these goals. 

Goals + means for their attainment

Motivational schemas

=

SATISFACTION
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Figure 7 Striving for congruence

Figure 8 Basic needs and motivational schemata

Attachment Selfesteem 

Striving for need satisfactionFeedback on need satisfaction

Pleasure / 
Avoidance 

of Pain

Systemlevel

Basic Needs

Motivational Schemata

Experience and 
Behavior 

Orientation / 
Control

Feedback on goal-
achievement

Bottom up activation 
of motivational 
schemata

Striving for consistencyFeedback on consistency

Approach
Schemata

Avoidance 
Schemata

Self-esteem

System level



Figure 9  (incongruence and discordance)

Discordance means that none of the simultaneously
activated regulating patterns can clearly determine
the psychological activity, for example when
approach and avoidance motives are activated
simultaneously. Incongruence means that the inter-
nal target state, an activated goal, isn‘t in accordance
with the external actual state, represented by the
actual perceptions. Both types of inconsistency sig-
nify unstable psychological situations. There is a high
level of current inconsistency and, as yet, no regu-
lating pattern has been established which could
effectively reduce the inconsistency.

In such an unstable psychological situation, new
patterns for the regulation of psychological activity
are likely to be formed. Activity fluctuates at a high
level of tension between different possible, but not
yet properly established regulating states, until one
of the fluctuating states is followed by a reduction of
inconsistency. 

Neural activation patterns synchronously actuated
at that moment are then joined together and differ-
entially reinforced by the reduction of inconsistency.
The first traces of a new neural group are formed. If
the same or a similar inconsistency situation occurs
repeatedly, the probability of the newly formed acti-
vation pattern being actuated increases. A new neu-
ral group or regulating pattern of mental activity is
established.

People have a need for orientation and control, for
experiencing pleasure and avoiding pain, for attach-
ment and for increasing and protecting their self-
esteem. According to biological and psychological
research, these needs can be considered innate and
indispensable basic needs of human beings. 

Every person develops during his or her life
course specific goals and means for the satisfaction
of these basic needs. These very well engrained reg-
ulating patterns of mental activity, which are geared
directly to the satisfaction of basic needs and the
prevention of their frustration, are designated in the
following as motivational schemata. They are so eas-
ily activated by internal states and external situa-
tions, that they determine the spontaneous activity
of psychological processes. They give psychological
activity an approaching or an avoiding quality. If an
individual feels needy with regard to one of his or
her basic needs and gets hurt in this state of needi-
ness – for example by always being rejected when
his/her attachment need is activated – he/she will
form avoidance schemata to protect himself/herself
from repeated harm. In the context of an environ-
ment which really is harmful, avoidance patterns can
be seen as adaptive. They help avoid perceptions
which are incongruent with the wishes of the indi-
vidual and therefore contribute to the preservation of
consistency. Since basic needs are unrenouncable
however, a prevalence of avoidance schemata will
inevitably lead to inconsistency in psychological
functioning. Situations relevant to needs activate
approach schemata which are geared to the satisfac-
tion of the need. At the same time, the avoidance
activation patterns resulting from past frustrations
are actuated. Now two incompatible motivational
tendencies, approach and avoicance goals, are
simultaneously activated. The activation of the
approach goals leads automatically to the activation
of the avoidance goals and thereby to a state of
inconsistency or discordance in the simultaneously
ongoing processes.
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Figure 10 (Incongruence as the motor of psycholog-
ical activity)

This could be a new regulating pattern which
improves the individual‘s possibilities of bringing
about need-satisfying experiences. In accordance
with Piaget, we could then speak of an accommoda-
tion of motivational schemata. In such an unstable
situation however, it‘s also possible for new mal-
adaptive patterns to develop, which do lead to a
decrease of the current inconsistency, but not to an
improved satisfaction of needs. 

Such a new maladaptive pattern could be a men-

tal disorder, for example a panic-attack. As unpleas-
ant as the newly developing neural activation pattern
pattern underlying the panic-attack may be, it effec-
tively reduces the previously present inconsistency
tension, because now mental experience is deter-
mined by one clear regulating pattern alone – the
experience of panic. By the reduction of inconsis-
tency, this new regulating pattern is differentially
reinforced. If the inconsistency situation persists for
a longer period of time, and if these proceedings are
repeated, the new regulating pattern becomes more
and more engrained. It detaches itself from the con-
ditions of its emergence and becomes functionally

autonomous. The activation of one part of a neural
group is sufficient to activate the whole pattern. The
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fear of the fear itself eventually leads to the panic-
attack.

According to these considerations, the current
inconsistency level of psychological activity is of
central importance for an individual’s wellbeing.
Motivational incongruence means that the wishes
and goals of the individual are poorly realized, and
this is accompanied by negative feelings. If this
becomes a permanent state the negative feelings
will accumulate and eventually result in a state of
poor well being. In addition, the enduring high
inconsistency tension is a breeding ground for the
development of psychopathological symptoms.

Thus consistency theory predicts that a high level
of incongruence will be strongly associated with
poor wellbeing and with the development of psycho-
pathological symptoms. This is indeed the case:

Over the last few years we developed a question-
naire for the measurement of motivational incon-
gruence. One part, consisting of 14 subscales, meas-
ures the incongruence regarding approach goals and
another part, consisting of 9 subscales, the incon-
gruence regarding avoidance goals. The items look
like this:

Figure 11

We gave this incongruence questionnaire together
with the SCL 90, the Inventory of Interpersonal Prob-
lems (Horowitz et al, 1994), the BDI and the BFW, a
well known German well being questionnaire, to dif-
ferent clinical and normal samples.

Maladaptive regulating pat -

terns reduce the current

incongruence, but instead of

leading to positive need-

satisfaction, they increase the

level of inconsistency long-

term and thereby contribute

to persisting incongruence.

In the case of current

incongruence, psychologi -

cal functioning is directed

towards eliminating resp.

reducing the incongruence.

Incongruence

the motor of psycho -

logical activity

New regulating patterns are established:

Adaptive regulating 

patterns 

=

new resources and

means for satisfying

needs
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Figure 12

Figure 13

As consistency theory predicts, the motivational incongruence is significantly higher in clinical than in non-
clinical samples. It was highest in the most severely disturbed patients.

Even more impressive are the within group correlations of incongruence, well being, and psychopathology.
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Figure 14

In other samples the correlations were even higher. In one sample the correlation between well being and
incongruence was -.87!

Thus incongruence actually goes together with poor well being, with a high level of psychopathology,
with depression and with interpersonal problems. This is true when we measure these variables at one
given time point. The question arises whether these strong connections do exist also for the pre-post-
change scores in the same variables resulting from therapy.

Figure 15

We see that the correlations are very similar. A reduction of inconsistency actually goes tightly together
with a reduction in psychopathology, in depression, and with an improvement of general well being.

With this empirical support we can conceive of incongruence as a core variable not only in mental func-
tioning but also in the therapy process.
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Figure 16

If we have a patient with a hightened level of incongruence a first logical question would be where the incon-
gruence comes from. There are many different possible sources of incongruence......

All these sources of incongruence are at the same time possible starting points of therapeutic interventions
aiming at reducing inconsistency. These possible starting points cover nearly the whole spectrum of psycho-
therapy. They have a joint aim, which is the increase in consistency in psychological functioning. This goal can
be promoted in very different ways. But this doesn‘t mean that the possible interventions are exchangeable at
random. Different sources of incongruence would require different types of interventions. Quite often, a
combination of different therapeutic procedures will be the most promising, because different sources of
inconsistency have to be taken into account at the same time.

We are now ready to draw conclusions about the agents of change in psychotherapy from the conception
developed so far:
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Figure 17

Incongruence reduction through need satisfaction is probably the most important function of the therapeutic
relationship.

Figure 18 
The more the therapist enables the patient to have perceptions corresponding to his basic needs for orienta-



Positive corrective experiences require both: process
actuation of the problems and, accompanying or fol-
lowing the actuation, positive mastery or clarifica-
tion experiences. Only through the joint effect of
both components can engrained activation tenden-
cies be overlaid with new ones.

Our conception of what constitutes fruitful correc-
tive experiences is yet still incomplete. Potentially
corrective experiences have to be inconsistent with
the patients previous activation tendencies, else they
wouldn’t be corrective. Therefore they lead first to an
increase of inconsistency and, by this, go against
what the organism actually strives for. They are
accompanied by negative feelings which normally
also are avoided. Actually one therefore should
expect resistance instead of compliance when one
tries to bring about corrective experiences with a
patient. Therefore situations leading to positive cor-
rective experiences must include a third component,
a need satisfying context. Only if the context, in
which the corrective experiences are embedded, pro-
vides the patient with sufficiently strong positive
experiences regarding his need for secure attach-
ment, for self enhancement, and for orientation and
control he/she will be open for incongruence pro-
ducing perceptions and ready to tolerate the nega-
tive feelings elicited by the incongruence. I will call
such a need satisfying context in the following a
resource activating context. 

Thus consistency theory predicts that the actua-
tion of problems in therapy will only contribute to a
good  therapeutic outcome if they are accompanied
by sufficiently strong need satisfying experiences
respectively resource activation.

(Part II will be published 
in our Newsletter 02-06)
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tion and control, for increasing self-esteem and for
attachment, the more the initially existing incongru-
ence with regard to these needs can be reduced. The
increase in congruence is accompanied by an
improvement in well-being. This in turn, has a posi-
tive effect on the relationship with the therapist and
on the receptiveness of the patient for other inter-
ventions. This has a positive influence on the com-
mitment of the therapist, which in turn results in con-
sistency-increasing perceptions for the patient. A
positive feedback process gets under way which, as
a whole, can be named resource activation. 

Consistency theory predicts that resource activa-
tion in itself, that means independently from any
other therapeutic work concerning the patient’s prob-
lems, will show itself as a primary agent of thera-
peutic change. The reason for that is that the need
satisfying experiences the patient makes in the
process of resource activation reduce his or her level
of incongruence and this leads immediately to an
improvement in well being and reduces the func-
tional importance of maladaptive patterns for incon-
sistency regulation. Thus the incongruence reduction
via resource activation is accompanied by a reduc-
tion in symptoms, of interpersonal problems, mal-
adaptive coping etc.

The second major change agent in the therapy
process according to consistency theory are correc-

tive experiences regarding the patient’s problems.
The neural activation tendencies underlying the
patient’s problematic experiencing and behaviour
can only be changed by being activated and overlaid
with new experiences. The weights of synaptic con-
nections can only be changed whilst a transference
of activation is actually taking place at the synapses.
The process actuation of the mental processes which
are to be changed is therefore a necessary condition
for every effective modification by psychological
means. The patient has to have experiences which
are inconsistent with his previous activation tenden-
cies, and this repeatedly. Then the intentionally
caused inconsistency can be resolved by the adap-
tation of the previous activation tendencies to the
new perceptions. In this process, new activation ten-
dencies are formed. A new consistency between
expectations and real experiences is established, due
to the adaptation of the former expectations to the
new experiences. The newly formed activation pat-
terns are reinforced by the increase in consistency.

PROF. KLAUS GRAWE, MD †
University of Bern



Taopsychotherapy and a Therapeutic 
Attitude 

Professor Rhee Dongshick, who originated and pio-
neered Taopsychotherapy as a new psychotherapy
model, has frequently expressed dire warnings
about the reality of the academic fields in present
day Korea by presenting an episode from the Walk-
of- Handan's People in Chuang Tzu. A tale found in
the Chuang Tzu tells of a young man from Sunung, in
Yuan who travels to Handan, the capital city of Zhou
during the period of the Warring States. His travels
were in the hope of learning from the Zhou people
but instead of learning how to walk like the people in
Handan, he duly forgets even his own style of walk -
and consequently, has to crawl all the way home. 

In the subsequent procession of Western academ-
ics pouring into Korea during the Japanese occupa-
tion, the existing traditional heritage of understand-
ing Nature and Man had been neglected and
alienated. Instead of undergoing a process of inde-
pendently assimilating new Westernized culture into
an existing level of traditional foundation, a reckless
tendency of imitating and copying Western culture
has prevailed throughout Korean society as a whole.
This phenomenon, functioning like an 'attitude of
assimilation' was no exception to most fields of aca-
demics, including psychotherapy. The tendency to
blindly follow Western psychoanalysis and psy-
chotherapy without any subjective understanding
and consideration had seemingly occurred without
question. 

Rather surprisingly and interestingly however, the
concepts of the 'unconscious' and the human mind
which were hitherto touted as discoveries in the West
in the 19th century, were in fact already manifestly
understood and clearly demonstrated in the East
over 2500 years ago, along with allied methods of
treatment. Methods of controlling one's mind and
achieving goals connected with this had also already
been identified and practiced. Western philosophers
like Schopenhauer and Nietzsche were widely known
as individuals who had been influenced by Eastern
thought and in fact it has now emerged that Freud
was heavily influenced by the philosophy of both
Schopenhauer (Young & Brook, 1994) and Nietzsche
(Lehrer, 1995).   

In more recent publications of the American Acad-
emy of Psychoanalysis and Dynamic Psychiatry's
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Taopsychotherapy and a Therapeutic Attitude 

official journal, there is an emerging theme indicat-
ing two current noteworthy trends in Western psy-
choanalysis/psychotherapy. One of these trends is
that in psychotherapy the aspect of understanding
the feelings or reality of a patient is more important
than theories, whilst the other trend indicates an
increasing interest shown towards Medard Boss,
who was influenced by Heidegger's 'Daseinsanaly-
sis'.

In Korea however, this subject was not totally
unfamiliar because Professor Rhee Dongshick's dia-
logue with Medard Boss over the course of two days
in Zollikon, Switzerland on July 12th and 15th 1976,
had already been published in a special issue of the
Journal of the Korean Academy of Psychotherapists,
in commemoration of the late Medard Boss (Rhee &
Boss, 1992). 

This dialogue in itself suggests an important point
from an historical perspective of Korean psy-
chotherapy. Medard Boss claims that the best West-
ern psychoanalytic practice in regard to the process
of purification of the mind is still at an introductory
level (Boss, 1976). But from a statement given by a
North American analyst of Daseinsanalysis who par-
ticipated in this 2004 Forum, it has been shown that
'Gelassenheit' - one of the core concepts of Heideg-
ger's philosophy and subsequently the philosophical
matrix of Daseinsanalysis and currently one of the
most progressive of the Western psychoanalyst
schools - was a German translation of Lao Tzu's con-
cept of wu wei (Craig, 2004). 

In September 2003, our KAP members organized
a symposium on the 'Taopsychotherapy of Psy-
choses' at the 14th International Symposium for the
Psychological Treatment of Schizophrenia and Other
Psychoses (ISPS) held in Melbourne, Australia.
Together with other prominent psychotherapists
from around the world, we exchanged opinions, crit-
icisms and held debates during this event. Dr. Garry
Prouty, a psychotherapist of the Rogers school from
Chicago, was one of the participants and he recently
informed me about how Carl Rogers always carried
a notebook of Lao Tzu phrases in his pocket. He also
mentioned that he is currently inquiring into whether
Rogers’ psychotherapy was developed after he was
influenced by Lao Tzu or, whether it was already
established before Rogers first came into contact
with the teachings of Lao Tzu. 

By deliberately looking at the historical aspects of
the birth and developmental stages of Western psy-



choanalysis/psychotherapy, the fact that its roots are
from Eastern thought is slowly being brought to light
in the West. However, although Eastern wisdom had
been introduced to Western culture, it has yet again
become constricted and constrained by the frame-
work of its traditional concepts and views. This has
led to an awareness of its propensity to become dis-
tanced from reality. As a result, there have been pro-
gressive movements away from the "conceptual
prison" (Barrett, 1956) in the West, in order to prop-
erly understand this reality. 

Unfortunately in the academic fields of psycho-
analysis/psychotherapy in Korea the resultant reality
is such that these efforts have arrived way too late to
be applied in such a way as to be able to truly light
the path of the West, which had already been judged
to be wrong by some Westerners and, which they
now themselves are struggling to break free from.
This phenomenon is embodied in the persistence of
holding fast to the overly rigid and narrow concepts
and skills of Western psychoanalysis. 

Professor Rhee Dongshick had realized and rec-
ognized these elements early on and has dedicated
himself to establishing a healthier and more evolu-
tionary worldview of psychotherapy. He managed to
do this by detaching from those elements that he
felt were overly 'tied down' by concepts and tech-
niques moving in the wrong direction within Western
psychotherapy. Instead, he used components of
Western psychotherapy which were developmentally
oriented towards the original purports of Eastern
thought and merged these with traditional Eastern
thought. Many people have standardized his work
by naming it 'Taopsychotherapy' and associating his
therapeutic methods with the concept of the East-
ern Tao. Accordingly, Professor Rhee has always
claimed that experienced and competent Western
psychotherapists who have freed themselves from
the hitherto rigid concepts and techniques of Western
thought, can easily understand Taopsychotherapy. In
this aspect, Taopsychotherapy and a revised Western
psychotherapy can be seen as mutually correspon-
ding. But the reality of psychotherapy in Korea is still
overly insistent on the concepts of Western psycho-
analysis. It strictly adheres to Western psychoanaly-
sis and views it as the Golden Rule, leading towards
a tendency to digress with regard to treating pre-
senting Korean patients. In this way therefore, this
misplaced internal attitude within Korea continues
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to persist whilst meanwhile, the reality is that Pro-
fessor Rhee has now attained more recognition
abroad for his treatments through continual dialogue
and exchange with overseas psychotherapists ever
since 1958.  

Since establishing the Korean Academy of Psy-
chotherapists in 1974, Professor Rhee has taught and
studied Western psychotherapy, Western thought,
Eastern thought, Korean history and culture with
regard to those of both the East and West for these
past 30 years. His experience as a psychiatrist for 63
years and his life experiences of 84 years have laid
the foundation which culminates in the fusing, merg-
ing and emerging of the Eastern Tao and Western
psychotherapy, to create Taopsychotherapy. 

The Essence of Taopsychotherapy: A Thera-
peutic Attitude

1. Emphasis on Feelings

Now, I would like to discuss what the most impor-
tant aspects in Taopsychotherapy are. 
One of the most important considerations in Taopsy-
chotherapy is to empathize with the patient's feel-
ings. Prof. Rhee insisted that the feelings of the psy-
chotherapist cure the patient's feelings. Of course,
emotion is similarly emphasized in Western psy-
chotherapy. 

However, Prof. Rhee indicated that Western col-
leagues do not seem to fully attend to  emotions,
even although they do describe mental disorders as
emotional disorders. He also felt that Western col-
leagues seem to respond to feelings 'intellectually',
in their practice as psychotherapists. 

Interestingly however, both Western psychother-
apy and Taopsychotherapy have now taken the same
direction of stressing feelings or emotions, whilst
Prof. Rhee has continued to carry a consistently
strong conviction of the need for this emphasis,
since his childhood. It is illuminating that Freud put
an emphasis on affect. Some Western psychothera-
pists who do emphasize feelings in psychotherapy -
like Leon J. Saul and Walter Bonime - have taken a
similar path to Taopsychotherapy.

According to Prof. Rhee, the principles of Taopsy-
chotherapy can apply within neurosis, psychosis and
psychosomatic disease quite irrespective of the diag-
nosis of the mental disorder. The only differences in
application of the therapeutic response relate directly
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to the period of the identified developmental stage
during which the patient experienced the trauma.
This reflects a need to pay deliberate attention to the
differing levels of consonant ego-strength in the
patient, as is similarly recognized in Western psycho-
therapy. 

In Taopsychotherapy, it is critical to empathize with
the patient's feelings in all types of mental disorders.
Prof. Rhee has repeatedly stated his perception that
even very severely psychotic patients suddenly
improved as soon as they expressed their feelings
and became aware of experiencing these feelings. 

2. Nuclear Feelings vs Central Dynamics 

In one of his papers published in 1970, Prof. Rhee
pointed out the primary importance of grasping and
overcoming the patient’s 'nuclear feelings' which
hold such sway over the patient’s mind and behavior
throughout his/her life at every moment. He argued
that nuclear feelings are the same as “something
stuck in the chest” which Tahui spoke of 1,000 years
ago. Also, he indicated that behind something stuck
in the chest are where nuclear feelings lie.

Western psychotherapists and psychoanalysts
also talk about the complex, central dynamics, major
motivation, nuclear dynamics, childhood emotional
patterns, basic dynamics, nuclear emotional con-
stellation, repetition compulsion and so on and so
forth. Whereas these various concepts described are
conceptually formulated by the therapist's objective
observation and explanation, the 'nuclear feelings'
which Prof. Rhee is referring to are characteristically
experiential and perceived by the therapist's mature
personality, such that the state of subject-object con-
gruence is experienced simultaneously with perfect
empathic capacity. 

Therefore in Prof. Rhee's Taopsychotherapy, he
quickly grasps the patient’s nuclear feelings and ther-
apy advances very quickly towards connecting with
the core. Charles Brenner (Pers. correspondence:
1994) commented that "it is remarkable how quickly
Professor Rhee penetrated to the essence of the
patient's complaint." 

In this context of stressing feelings, Prof. Rhee
pointed out the importance of grasping and over-
coming the patient's subjective 'nuclear feelings' in
psychotherapy by comparing this practice with the
ox in the Ten-Oxen-Pictures; these pictures have tra-
ditionally described the process of awakening in Zen
practice (Rhee: 1993). According to him, there is a

clear parallel between the nuclear feelings and the
ox in Tao practice. 

3. The Importance of Compassion in Taopsycho-

therapy

Another one of the most important issues in
Taopsychotherapy is how the therapist can come to
fully empathize with their patients' feelings. This
issue is based upon the premise that it is most
important that the therapist be 'in-tune' (empathize)
with the patient's subjective, inner feelings. This
question of how well the therapist understands the
patient's feelings is very seriously attended to in
Taopsychotherapy, as compared with Western psy-
chotherapy. In fact, the emphasis on this issue is
probably the most distinctively contrasted aspect
between Taopsychotherapy and Western psycho-
therapy. 

In Taopsychotherapy, considerable emphasis is
placed upon the developmental and/or maturation
process (maturity) of the therapist. Prof. Rhee always
says, "The therapist should treat a patient with
his/her own compassion or, the therapist should
have compassion and the patient will be cured by it."
During the International Forum on Taopsychotherapy
and Western Psychotherapy held in 2004, Seoul, Pro-
fessor Allan Tasman revealed a very important point
for enquiry in his phrasing of two questions about
Professor Rhee's Taopsychotherapy, which claims a
therapist must empathize with the patient's core
emotions in order to treat him/her, by asking "How
does one empathize well with a patient's emotions
and also, how can one go about teaching it in reality
as an academic field of study?" Within this question,
Professor Tasman further enquired into whether a
training therapist would need some type of originat-
ing frame of reference, in order to learn how to
embody empathic process in the early stages of their
training. Professor Rhee answered that a therapist's
mind must be in a state of 'fasting' the mind, in order
to empathize with the emotions of others. Also, that
the practice of psychotherapy should be such that
the practitioner will be guided by and to a situation
of self-experience. 

In Daseinsanalysis, it is "care" (sorge) of existence,
as a kind of shepherding of all that is encountered
(Craig: 1988). According to Carlos Alberto Seguin
(Seguin: 1965), it is named as "Psychotherapeutic
Eros", as Boss quoted (Boss: 1963). Jerome Frank
said, "A good therapist has a real desire to help
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people" (Frank: 1998). These are different terms
which indicate the same qualities. In Prof. Rhee's
Taopsychotherapy, a therapist's compassion is the
most important quality to embody, in order to attain
perfect empathy with his/her patient's feelings.

•  An Example of Dialogue Between Boss and Rhee

Dongshick in Zollikon: Compassionsion and Self-

lessness

During several conversations between Medard
Boss and Rhee Dongshick in June of 1976 in Zollikon,
Zurich, they stressed the importance of the thera-
pist's love, the compassion and selflessness as an
attitude of the therapist. 

Here is a part of their dialogue (in expanded trans-
lation): 

Prof. Boss: Yes, Western psychotherapy mainly only
goes so far as liberating hate and love. Since hate
and love are both attachments, most therapists stop
at the liberation of these emotions whereas medita-
tion goes further on to free the person from these
attachments and encouragingly continues to help
them to become a Bodhisattva. 
Prof. Rhee: Yes, it is my impression (that) therapy
should have the spirit of Bodhisattva, selflessness. In
reality though, therapists lack this spirit of Bod-
hisattva. 
Prof. Boss: It's a kind of selflessness. To simply give
the patient freedom, the space into which he can
develop his own being, without wanting something
for yourself from the patient. 
Prof. Rhee:That is wu wei of Lao Tzu. 
Prof. Boss:That's rare. That's the aim of one thera-
pist [Carlos Alberto Seguin] from Peru, "Psychother-
apeutic Eros". He means the same thing. Psy-
chotherapeutic Eros is superior even to the goal
(that) is the prescribed love of the priest for his belief
in God, because he still wants something from God. 

3. How to Attain Complete Compassion

Thirdly, one of the most important things in Taopsy-
chotherapy is the issue of how the therapist can
reach the state of complete compassion. In other
words, how a therapist can attain perfect empathy so
as to understand the patient's feelings. For this pur-
pose, therapists should resolve (remove) their own
nuclear feelings (neurotic desires) through purifica-
tion of their minds. This is one of the distinctively

different issues worked with in Taopsychotherapy.

4. Interpretation and 'Directly Pointing At the Human

Mind'

In Western psychoanalysis/psychotherapy the act
of interpreting, as the primary communication link
between analyst and patient, may also serve to
transmit empathy, concern and care, particularly as
an accompaniment to the painful content of the
interpretation (Kaplan: 1989). It is also mentioned
that in the ideal situation, interpretation is designed
to make the patient consciously aware of uncon-
scious (or preconscious) material that is close to the
surface of consciousness (Sadock & Sadock: 2000)
or, that pointing out what the patient does not report
can be effective. 

Comparable with this in Taopsychotherapy, inter-
pretations are viewed as 'directly pointing at the
patient's mind' and the therapist is viewed as
expressing perfect empathy, in the state of subject-
object congruence. 

In the paper, "Integration of East and West Psy-
chotherapy: Prof. Rhee Dongshick's Case", Prof. Kang
explained some characteristics of Prof. Rhee's inter-
pretation. 

He described Prof. Rhee's interpretations as a
form of "killing and making alive" or "taking life and
giving life" within nature (Kang: 1996). Summers also
commented upon Prof. Rhee's Taopsychotherapy as
"soothing and stimulating the client at the same
time" (Pers. communication: 2004). In Zen dialogue,
Masters usually use this type of interpretation to cut
through their disciples' delusions or discriminating
thoughts. In addition, Prof. Kang described another
characteristic interpretation of Prof Rhee's as "cut-
ting away the roots of the patient's dependency and
hostility" (Kang: 1996).

Taopsychotherapy and Western 
Psychotherapy: 
Similarities and Differences

•  Differences: Only by Degree and/or Level

In his paper, "The Tao, Psychoanalysis and Existential
Thought" (Rhee: 1990), Prof. Rhee spoke of both the
common elements and differences between Eastern
Tao, psychoanalysis and existential thought. He com-
pared the goal of the eastern Tao with that of Western
psychoanalysis and psychotherapy. He concluded
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that the goal of Western psychoanalysis/ psycho-
therapy and Eastern Tao is the same and the only
difference is one of degree or level. He also com-
pared the processes of psychoanalysis and Zen prac-
tice and concluded that both of the processes are
the same, but only up to a particular point. 

•  Transference vs Nuclear Feelings

One of the most commonly asked questions by
Western psychoanalysts about Prof. Rhee's Taopsy-
chotherapy is, "In Western psychoanalysis, one of the
most important aspects is understanding and solv-
ing the patient’s transference feelings. In Taopsy-
chotherapy, how is this aspect of treatment carried
out?" Prof. Rhee maintains that Taopsychotherapy lit-
erally attends to the transference of nuclear feelings. 
In other words, attention to transference and nuclear
feelings may both proceed in a similar direction, but
'nuclear' feelings in Taopsychotherapy tend to be
considerably more focused upon and in particular,
the core aspect of these feelings. This is the similar-
ity and yet difference between these two elements of
attending to the client's subjectivity.

•  Analytic Neutrality and Resistance

Freud did not actually use the word, 'neutrality' in his
writings; he used the German word 'indifferenz' and
James Strachey translated this into English as 'neu-
trality'. 
In fact, Freud was concerned about both the vulner-
ability of his colleagues to 'act out' countertransfer-
ential material and, the tendency of some analysts to
misuse the analytic situations to talk about them-
selves (Sadock & Sadock: 2000). 
There are parallels in this context between Taopsy-
chotherapy and Freud's psychoanalysis. In Taopsy-
chotherapy, Prof. Rhee stresses the importance of
active involvement of the therapist's mature person-
ality. Similarly, both written reports from Freud’s own
analysands and his published case material indicate
that Freud’s own personality was very much involved
in the analytic process (Sadock & Sadock: 2000).
As to the concept of the patient's 'resistance' within
psychoanalysis, the viewpoint of Taopsychotherapy
is that this interpretation can actually represent a
lack of empathy in the therapist. Prof. Rhee argues
that this concept is a therapist-centered idea, and
that the subjective, experiential aspect of the patient
is the only reality for consideration.

Summary

To reiterate, Taopsychotherapy is the fusion of East-
ern Tao and Western psychotherapy. 

It surely is difficult for us to reach that state, but
we can be more mature as therapists when we
become aware of the possibility of a higher standard
and try to attain it. 

This can be the contribution of Taopsychotherapy
to Western psychotherapy. 

In summary, the essence of Taopsychotherapy is
that the feelings of the therapist are utilized to treat
the nuclear feelings of the patient which hold sway
over the patient’s mind and behaviour, from the ges-
ture of a hand to the peculiarity of breathing,
throughout his/her life at every moment. In order to
understand the patient's feelings, the therapist
should both have and develop compassion which
can be attained by resolution of the therapist’s
nuclear feelings through purification of the mind. 

The goal of Western psychoanalysis/psychother-
apy and Eastern Tao is the same and the only differ-
ence is one of degree and/or level. In other words,
the process of Western psychoanalysis and Zen prac-
tice are the same, but only up to a particular point.
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Wen-Shing Tseng, Jon Streltzer (eds.) (2001)
Culture & Psychotherapy. A Guide to Clinical
Practice. American Psychiatric Press Inc.,
Washington DC

This is a remarkable book and a must-read for all
those who are concerned with cross-cultural psy-
chotherapy. The editors, Wen-Shing Tseng and Jon
Streltzer are international experts in cultural psychi-
atry and have published numerous articles and text-
books on related topics. Tseng is the author of the
classic reference work “The Handbook of Cultural
Psychiatry” (2001), which definitely established him
as the leading expert in cultural psychiatry. Among
many more positions he has served as chairman of
Transcultural Psychiatric Section of World Psychiatric
Association and as a consultant to the World Health
Organization.

Culture & Psychotherapy. A Guide to Clinical Practice
(first published in 2001) has been referred to as a
“more affordable alternative” to Tseng’s compre-
hensive and encyclopaedic “Handbook of Cultural
Psychiatry”. This favorable statement gives a idea of
the rich contents of this handy 300-pages work. The
editors succeed in bringing together instructive con-
tributions from various experienced scholars and
therapists, many of them collaborators of them at
University of Hawaii Medical School. The book is
written mainly from a North American perspective
and provides therefore excellent information on
many specific American populations: African Ameri-
cans, Native Americans, Hispanics, Chinese and
Japanese immigrants, army veterans, and refugees
from Southeast Asia. Since all topics are presented
in a paradigmatic manner in order to teach culture-
specific approaches in general, also non-American
readers will largely benefit from the reading.

The book aims to describe and to clarify the practice
of cross-cultural psychotherapy. “Culture” is used as
a key concept in this book and is distinguished from
terms like race, ethnicity, or minority. Tseng defines
culture as a dynamic concept referring to a set of
beliefs, attitudes, and value systems, that derive
from early stages of life through enculturation and
become an internal mode of regulating behavior,

Book Review



action, and emotion. According to Tseng, culture is
not static, but changing continously through the gen-
erations in response to environmental demands. Fur-
thermore, culture in this sense is specific for each
individual and therefore much more important than
ethnicity or race. Experienced therapists usually tai-
lor psychotherapy to each patient’s particular situa-
tion, to the nature of psychopathology, to the stage
of therapy, and so on. Treatment could be a lot more
effective, however, when the cultural dimension is
factored in. The resulting culturally relevant psy-
chotherapy involves the understanding of how cul-
ture enhances the meaning of the patient’s life his-
tory, clarifies the nature of any stress that may be
encountered, alters the coping patterns utilized and
influences the present psychopathology. It also
includes comprehending the cultural components of
the patient’s illness and help-seeking behaviors, as
well as the patient’s expectations of the therapist.

Fifteen chapters by twenty different authors give a
colorful overview of the clinical practice in many dif-
ferent contexts. All chapters are illustrated with vivid
case examples and therefore a fascinating reading.
Important issues treated are: integration of spiritual
beliefs in psychotherapy, religion and psychother-
apy, ethnic transference and countertransference,
giving and recieving medications, severe trauma in
refugees, ethnic minority adolescents and elderly,
marital therapy, group therapy. In the whole, this
book combines theoretical explanations with practi-
cal examples in a balanced manner. It is obvious to
the reader, that all topics are treated out of profound
knowledge and experience by the authors. The book
does not overemphasize specific therapeutic theo-
ries, but illustrates how different therapeutic
approaches can be adapted to individual needs of
patients from different cultures.

A particular highlight to me is chapter 12 The South-
east Asian Refugee: The Legacy of Severe Trauma by
David Kinzie. The author presents a most impressive
case example of a 10-year therapy with a female
Cambodian refugee. Out of his enormous clinical
and scientific experience, Kinzie gives a brilliant tes-
timony of the effect of long-term culture-sensitive
psychotherapy. By the given example, he illustrates
how the therapeutic alliance (or the human relation-
ship) surmounts any technical issues of psychother-
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apy and how basic human attitudes like respect,
esteem, reliability, integrity, and patience are highly
important in any form of treatment. Maybe this is
the most valuable lesson any psychotherapist can
learn from this book.
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